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REPORT  

FRAUDULENT & CORRUPT ACTIVITIES ON GOVERNMENT PROCUREMENT SYSTEM 

_____________________ 

National Anti-Corruption @ 0800 701 701 

Security and Investigating Services – Limpopo Provincial Treasury @ 015 298 7196 

___________________________ 

 

ALL COMPLAINTS/CONCERNS RELATED TO SCM NON-COMPLIANCE MUST BE REPORTED TO: 

LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL TREASURY 

PRIVATE BAG X 9486 

POLOKWANE  

0700 

 

PROVINCIAL TREASURY, FINANCE HOUSE, 56 – 58 PAUL KRUGER STREET, POLOKWANE  
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2. INSTRUCTIONS 

 

 

1. Bidders are advised to read the entire tender bulletin.   

2. Tenders for procurement of supplies, services and disposals are categorized as follows: 

SUPPLIES 

▪ Accommodation, leasing of 
▪ Audio visual equipment 
▪ Building material 

▪ Chemicals: Agricultural/Forestry/ 
▪ Laboratory/Water Care 
▪ Clothing/Textiles 

▪ Computer equipment 
▪ Computer software 
▪ Electrical equipment 

▪ Electronic equipment 
▪ Furniture 
▪ General 

▪ Medical 
▪ Office equipment: Labour-saving devices 

▪ Perishable provisions 
▪ Stationary/printing 
▪ Steel 

▪ Timber 
▪ Vehicle (all types) 
▪ Workshop equipment 

 

SERVICES 

▪ Building 
▪ Civil 
▪ Electrical 

▪ Functional (including cleaning-, 
▪ and security services) 
▪ General 

▪ Maintenance of electrical, mechanical 
▪ equipment and plumbing 
▪ Mechanical 

▪ Professional 
▪ Repair and maintenance of vehicles 
▪ Transport 

 
 

DISPOSALS 
▪ Clothing and textiles 
▪ Furniture 

▪ General 
▪ Scrap metal 

▪ Vehicles 

3. Bid documents are generally available in English only.  

4. The address where a bid document is available from and where it must be submitted to may differ.  

5. The addresses at which bid documents may be obtained and tenders must be posted, appear in Annexure 1. 

6.  The address list of various Supply Chain Management Advice Centres at which bid documents and tender bulletins 

may also be obtained, appear in Annexure 3; and 

7. The address list of Supply Chain Management satellite offices at which tender bulletins may also be obtained, appear 

in Annexure 4. 
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3. BID INVITATION FOR SUPPLIERS, SERVICES AND DISPOSALS 

 

 
BID NO. 

 
DESCRIPTION OF  

SERVICE OR SUPPLIES 

CONTACT DETAILS  
BID 

DOCUME
NT 

PRICE 

(NON-
REFUND
ABLE) 

 
DUE AT 

11H00 

 
BID 

DOCUMEN
TS 

OBTAINAB

LE FROM 

 
POST 

OR 
DELIV

ER 

BIDS 
TO 

 

(See 
Annex

ure 1 
& 2) 

 

PUDP 

776 
 
 

 Supply and delivery of 25 

Litre Hand Sanitisers. 
 
N.B: No Compulsory Briefing 

Session. Use the indicated 
email addresses for any 
enquiries  

 
 
 

Department of Transport 
and Community Safety 

 

Technical  

Enquiries Contact: 
 

Mr Ndlala P @ (015) 

295 1027 
ndlalap@dtcs.limpop
o.gov.za  

 
Mr Maenetja O @ 
015 294 8223 

maenetjao@dtcs.limp
opo.gov.za 

 
Administrative  
enquiries contact: 

Ms Bopape M 
@ (015) 294 8420 
bopapemm@dtcs.lim

popo.gov.za 

NONE 17/02/2022 http://www.l

dot.gov.za 

105 

HEDP032/2
1/22 

Supply, Delivery, Installation,  
Acceptance, Commissioning 
and Maintenance of 

Mammogram Units in the  
Department of Health for the  

Period Of Thirty – Six (36) 
Months 
 

Compulsory Site Visits: 
Philadelphia Hospital – 
17/01/2022 @10h00am 

Bidding process 
Ms. SimangoT.O  
(015) 293 6352  / (071) 

861 9937 
Ms. Motene N.M  

015) 293 6350 / (063) 
692 9368 
 

Technical  
specification 
Dr F Sithole 

NONE 28/01/2022 www.doh.li
mpopo.gov.
za or 

www.etend
ers.gov.za 

103 

mailto:ndlalap@dtcs.limpopo.gov.za
mailto:ndlalap@dtcs.limpopo.gov.za
mailto:maenetjao@dtcs.limpopo.gov.za
mailto:maenetjao@dtcs.limpopo.gov.za
mailto:bopapemm@dtcs.limpopo.gov.za
mailto:bopapemm@dtcs.limpopo.gov.za
http://www.doh.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.doh.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.doh.limpopo.gov.za/
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St Rita’s Hospital  - 

18/01/2022 @10h00am 
Letaba Hospital -19/01/2022 
Tshilidzini Hospital – 

20/01/2022 @10h00am 
Mokopane Hospital – 
21/01/2022 @10h00am 

 
 
Department of Health 

015 286 1610 & 082 407 

8317 

CCTV/2021

/09/11/04 

 

Supply , Delivery and 

Installation of    Desktop 
Computers 

BRIEFING SESSION 

02 December 2021 

Central Office at - 10h00 

(Compulsory) 

 

Capricorn TVET College 

Enquiries: 

 
Mamabolo MR 

Tel: 015 230 1800 

R1000 

only EFT 
made in 

favour of 
Capricorn 
TVET 

College 
Account 
No 

11506203
72 Absa 
cheque 

account): 
No bid 
documen

t will be 
sold at 

the site 
briefing 
session 

14 December 

2021 

at 14H00 

Central Office  

121 121 

CCTVET/2

021/11/05 

 

Appointment of Debt 

Collectors For a Period of  
Three(03) years) 

 

  BRIEFING SESSION 

03 December 2021 

Central Office at - 10h00 

(Compulsory)  

 

 

 

 

 

 

Capricorn TVET College 

 

 R1000 

only EFT 
made in 
favour of 

Capricorn 
TVET 
College 

Account 
No 

11506203
72 Absa 
cheque 

account): 
No bid 
documen

t will be 
sold at 
the site 

briefing 
session 

15 December 

2021 

at 10H00 

Central Office 

121 121 



LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL TENDER BULLETIN NO. 35 of 2021/22 FY 26 NOVEMBER 2021 

NOT FOR SALE Page 7 
    

 

 

CCTVET/2
021/11/06 

 

Appointment of Forensic 
Auditors 

 

BRIEFING SESSION 

02 December 2021 

Central Office at 17h00 

(Non-Compulsory) 

 

 

 

 

 

Capricorn TVET College 

 R1000 
only EFT 
made in 

favour of 
Capricorn 
TVET 

College 
Account 
No 

11506203
72 Absa 

cheque 
account): 
No bid 

documen
t will be 
sold at 

the site 
briefing 
session 

15 December 
2021 

at 17h00 

Central Office 

121 121 

CCTVET/SI

FA/2021/11
/03 

 

Declaration of Interest for 

Provision of Architectural and 
design services 

Complimented by related 
engineering services in the  
following fields: (Electrical, 

Civil, Mechanical) and 
Quantity  survey for a FACT 
Centre at Seshego campus 

(Pre-qualification) 

BRIEFING SESSION 

08 December 2021 

 

Central Office at 10h00 

(Non –Compulsory) 

 

 

 

 

Capricorn TVET College 

 R1000 

only EFT 
made in 

favour of 
Capricorn 
TVET 

College 
Account 
No 

11506203
72 Absa 
cheque 

account): 
No bid 
documen

t will be 
sold at 

the site 
briefing 
session 

06 January 

2022 

At 10H00 

Central Office  

121 121 

CCTVET/1

1/2021/07/0
1-05 
 

Provision of cleaning services 

for a period of three (03) 
years at 
Seshego,Polokwane,Senwab

 R1000 

only EFT 
made in 
favour of 

Capricorn 

14 December 

2021 

at 14H00 

121 121 
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arwana, Ramokgopa, and 

Central  Office)   
 
BRIEFING SESSION 

03 December 2021 
Central Office at - 11h00 
(Compulsory) 

 
 
 

Capricorn TVET College 

TVET 

College 
Account 
No 

11506203
72 Absa 
cheque 

account): 
No bid 
documen

t will be 
sold at 

the site 
briefing 
session 

Central Office 

COGHSTA 

B13/2021–
22 FY 

 Appointment Of Principal 

Agent To Manage The 
Construction Of Bulk 
Services, Construction Of 514 

Units And Engineering 
Services At Marapong 
Extension 6 (Marapong Cru 

Projects) In Lephalale Within 
Limpopo For A Period Of 12 
Months 

 
Department of Co-operative 

Governance, Human 
Settlements and Traditional 
Affairs 

Technical 

requirements: 
Mr. Mogotsi K @ 
015 284 5471, 

Maisela ND @ 
015 284 1841, 

Lamola RM @ 
015 284 5111, 
Mpyatona S @ 

015 284 5128 
 

Administration 
information: 
Mr. Mokalapa MJ @ 

015 294 2262, Ms. 
Masenya J.T @ 015 
294 2290 and Mr. 

Masemola S.S @015 
294 2024 

 

NONE 18/01/2022 www.limp

opo.cogh
sta.gov.z
a 

106 
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 4. CANCELLED BIDS 

 
 

4.1 Department of Economic Development, Environment and Tourism 

 

Bid No. Project Description Tender Bulletin 

No.  

Date 

Advertised 

Date 

closed 

Reason for 

Cancellation 
 

EDET 
259/2020 

Request for proposal issued by 
Limpopo Department of 

Economic Development, 
Environment and Tourism in 
respect of the proposed Public 

Private Partnership  project for 
the development of tourism 
opportunities in the  

Lekgalemeetse Nature Reserve 

 23 OF 2020/21 
FY, 

11/12/2020 25/02/2021 Non-
responsive 

bids 

EDET 
260/2020 

Request for proposal issued by 
Limpopo Department of 
Economic Development, 

Environment and Tourism in 
respect of the proposed public 

private partnership project for 
the development of tourism 
opportunities in Rust de winter 

Nature Reserve 

 23 OF 2020/21 
FY, 

11/12/2020 25/02/2021 Non-
responsive 
bids 

EDET 
261/2020 

Request for proposal issued by 
Limpopo Department of 
Economic Development, 

Environment and Tourism in 
respect of operating and 
managing existing tourism 

facilities and activities in 
Masebe Nature Reserve 

 23 OF 2020/21 
FY, 

11/12/2020 25/02/2021 Non-
responsive 
bids 

 

 
 
4.2 Independent Development Trust (on behalf of Department of Education) 

 

TENDER  
BULLETIN 
NO. 

BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION ADVERTIED 
DATE 

CLOSING 
DATE 

REASON FOR 
CANCELLATIO
N 

18 of 2021/22 
FY (23 July 

2021) 

LDE/IA/B09/201
9/20(EDDP 

184/247)  

Construction of Nkgopoleng 
Bakone Secondary school 

23 July 2021 26 August 
2021 

Non 
Compliance 
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6 ERRATUM 

 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 
 

                      NOTICE TO ALL BIDDERS 

 

  AMENDMENT OF HEDP NUMBER ON THE BID DOCUMENT: SUPPLY, DELIVERY, INSTALLATION, COMMISSIONING AND 
MAINTENANCE OF VARIOUS MEDICAL EQUIPMENT INCLUDING CONSUMABLES FOR THE LIMPOPO OF DEPARMTENT 

OF HEALTH-THIRTY SIX (36) MONTHS PERIOD. 

The above matter refers: 

1. The above-mentioned bid was advertised in the Provincial Tender Bulletin No.32 of 21/22 Financial Year, dated 05 
November 2021, with a closing date 06 December 2021.The bid was advertised with HEDP038/20/21 however the bid 

document was published with HEDP 004//20/21 which is erroneous. 
 

2. Prospective bidders are hereby notified that the Department has amended the HEDP number on the bid document to 

HEDP038/21/22 and withdrawn the initial document on the Departmental website and on eTenders portal, and replace d it. 

 
3. The below table illustrates the amended Bid number as per Bid document:  

INITIAL BID NUMBER NEW BID NUMBER 

HEDP004/20/21 HEDP038/21/22 

 

Enquiries may be directed to the below officials: 

                                                      Contact details:  

 

Bidding process Technical specification 

Ms. SimangoT.O  

(015) 293 6352  / (071) 861 9937 

Ms. Matjila M.T 

(015) 2287 5243 / (083) 437 1056 

 
 

Ms. Motene  N.M 

(015) 293 6350 /  (063) 692 9368 
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7 SPECIAL NOTICES 
 

 
 

6.1 INDEPENDENT DEVELOPMENT TRUST (ON BEHALF OF DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION) 

 
NOTICE: EXTENSION OF BIDS VALIDITY  

 
The Independent Development Trust (IDT) on behalf of the Limpopo Department of Education hereby extend 
the validity period of the below tenders as they are still under evaluation and awaiting Bid Adjudication 
Committee Approval. The 90 days validity will be lapsing and bidders are hereby notified of the extension of 
tender validity by 45 days as per the each bid closing: 
 
 

no BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION CURRENT 
EXPIRYDATE 

45 DAYS 
VALIDITY DATE 

1 LDE/IA/B07/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/119) 

Construction of School at 
Ngwanalaka Secondary School 

2021.11.25 2022.01.09 

2 LDE/IA/B05/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/70) 

Construction of School at 
Makgongoana Secondary  

2021.11.24 2022.01.08 

3 LDE/IA/B16/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/309) 

Construction of School at 
Mathede Secondary School 

2021.1124 2022.01.08 

4 LDE/IA/B03/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/318) 

Construction of School at 
Mpelegeng Primary School 

2021.11.25 2022.01.09 

5 LDE/IA/B17/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/209) 

Construction of School at 
Tshadama Secondary School 

2021.11.25 2022.01.09 

6 LDE/IA/B12/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/350) 

Construction of School at 
Tshamiseka Primary School 

2021.11.25 2022.01.09 

7 LDE/IA/B15/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/287) 

Construction of School at M.R 
Mamaila Primary School 

2021.11.25 2022.01.09 

8 LDE/IA/B14/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/279) 

Construction of School at 
Khumelong Primary School 

2021.11.24 2022.01.08 

9 LDE/IA/B13/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/300) 

Construction of School at Mang 
le Mang Secondary school 

2021.11.24 2022.01.08 

10 LDE/IA/B14/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/320) 

Construction of School at Molai 
Jubilee Secondary School 

2021.11.25 2022.01.09 

11 LDE/IA/B08/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/196) 

Construction of School at Nhlayisi 
Secondary School 

2021.11.24 2022.01.08 

12 LDE/IA/B10/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/229) 

Construction of School at DZJ 
Mtembule Secondary School 

2021.11.26 2022.01.10 

13 LDE/IA/B06/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/81) 

Construction of School at  
Manthe Primary School 

2021.11.26 2022.01.10 

14 LDE/IA/B01/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/334) 

Construction of School at 
Rantobeng Secondary school  

2021.11.26 2022.01.10 

15 LDE/IA/B02/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/209) 

Construction of School at John 
Xikundu Primary school  

2021.11.26 2022.01.10 

16 LDE/IA/B22/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/150) 

Construction of School at B.K 
Matlala Secondary School 

2021.12.01 2022.01.15 

17 LDE/IA/B23/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/122) 

Construction of School at Makelle 
Primary School 

2021.12.01 2022.01.15 

18 LDE/IA/B29/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/316) 

Construction of School at 
Monyong Secondary School 

2021.12.01 2022.01.15 

19 LDE/IA/B21/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/23) 

Construction of School at April 
Makgakga Primary School 

2021.12.01 2022.01.15 
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no BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION CURRENT 
EXPIRYDATE 

45 DAYS 
VALIDITY DATE 

20 LDE/IA/B19/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/137) 

Construction of School at 
Seshigo Primary School 

2021.12.01 2022.01.15 

21 LDE/IA/B20/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/152) 

Construction of School at 
Matokane  Secondary School 

2021.12.02 2022.01.16 

22 LDE/IA/B36/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/111) 

Construction of School at 
Mphetsebe Secondary School 

2021.12.02 2022.01.16 

23 EDDP (184/111) Phase 2 Construction of School at 
Mkhachani Mzamani Primary 
School 

2021.12.02 2022.01.16 

24 EDDP 184/216 Construction of School at Monala  
Primary  School 

2021.12.02 2022.01.16 

25 LE20IDT00159 Construction of School at 
Ramphelane Secondary  School 

2021.12.02 2022.01.16 

26 EDDP 184/82 Construction of School at 
Mapangula   Primary  School 

2021.12.02 2022.01.16 

27 EDDP 184/232 Construction of School at 
Mahwahwa High School 

2021.12.03 2022.01.17 

28 LDE/IA/B32/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/325) 

Construction of School at Nkomo 
Maboko Secondary School 

2021.12.03 2022.01.17 

29 LDE/IA/B31/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/294) 

Construction of School at 
Mahumane Secondary School 

2021.12.03 2022.01.17 

30 LDE/IA/B28/2019/20 (EDDP 
184/120) 

Construction of School at 
Nkoshillo Secondary School 

2021.12.03 2022.01.17 

31 EDDP 184/319 Construction of School at 
Mphareng Primary  School 

2021.12.03 2022.01.17 

 
 
 

 
7. GENERAL NOTICES 

 
 
 
LIMPOPO (SCM ADVICE CENTERS) CSD CALL CENTRE LINES FOR SUPPLIERS  
  

DISTRICT 
 
 

CALL CENTRE NUMBER OFFICIAL RESPONSIBLE TIME 

Capricorn 015 291 2684 Mr. Kgomo AE 07H30 TO 16H30 
Mopani 015 812 0256 Ms. Nxumalo P 07H30 TO 16H30 
Sekhukhune 013 265 1071 Mrs Morena MM 07H30 TO 16H30 

Vhembe 015 962 0014 Mrs. Nefolovhodwe MQ 07H30 TO 16H30 
Waterberg 014 717 1376 Mrs. Tsatsi AT  07H30 TO 16H30 

 
 
 
PLANNED PROVINCIAL PROCUREMENT OPPORTUNITIES 
 
Bidders and general members of the public can access Procurement Plans of all Limpopo Provincial Departments and Public 
Entities for the 2021/2022 Financial Year by following the link below: 
 

http://www.limtreasury.gov.za/lim_admin_trea/pages/sites/treasury_lim/documents/bids_notice/LPG%20DE
PTS%20PROCUREMENT%20PLAN%202021_22_2308.pdf 

http://www.limtreasury.gov.za/lim_admin_trea/pages/sites/treasury_lim/documents/bids_notice/LPG%20DEPTS%20PROCUREMENT%20PLAN%202021_22_2308.pdf
http://www.limtreasury.gov.za/lim_admin_trea/pages/sites/treasury_lim/documents/bids_notice/LPG%20DEPTS%20PROCUREMENT%20PLAN%202021_22_2308.pdf
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ANNEXURE 1:   ADDRESS LIST AND CONTACT DETAILS: LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL DEPARMENTS 
 

UNIQUE 
REF. 
NO. 

BID 
DOCUMENT 
REFERENCE 

 
CONTACT DETAILS 
 

 
DOCUMENTS SOLD AT: 

 
DOCUMENTS 
DEPOSITED AT 

 
100 

DSDP 

 
Tel:  015 293 6000 
Fax: 015 293 6211 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Social Development, 
Office No. 57 Ground Floor, 21 Biccard 
Street POLOKWANE  

Deposited in the box 
located at Department of 
Social Development, 21 
Biccard Street 
Polokwane 

 
101 

LPT 

 
Tel: 015 298 7000 
Fax: 015 295 7010 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Provincial Treasury  46 Hans Van 
Rensburg Street, POLOKWANE and all 
Provincial T reasury Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box 
located outside a guard 
house at Ismini Towers, 
46 Hans Van Rensburg 
Street, Polokwane 

 
101A 

TC/LP  

 
Tel:  015 291 8400 
Fax:  015 295 3310 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Provincial Treasury  56 – 58  Paul Kruger 
Street, POLOKWANE and all Provincial 
T reasury Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box 
located in the main 
entrance, Finance 
House Building, 56-58 
Paul Kruger Street, 
Polokwane 

 
102 

PRDP  

 
Tel: 015 287 6000 
Fax: 015 295 3840 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Office of the Premier, 40 Hans van 
Rensburg Street, POLOKWANE and all 
SCM Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box 
located at Mowaneng 
Building, 40 Hans van 
Rensburg Street, 
Polokwane 

 
103 

HEDP 

 
Tel:  015 293 6000 
Fax: 015 293 6211 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Health, Office No. D3 
Ground Floor, Old Capricorn Building, 18 
College Street, POLOKWANE and all 
Provincial T reasury Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the box 
located at Department of 
Health and Social 
Development, 18 
College Street, 
Polokwane 

 
 

104 
LPEDT 

 
Tel:  015 290 7600/1 
Fax: 015 297 4494 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Education, Corner 113 
Biccard and 24 Excelsior Streets, 
POLOKWANE and all Provincial T reasury 
Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box 
located in the main 
entrance of corner 113 
Biccard Street and 
Excelsior Street, 
Polokwane 

 
 

105 PUDP 

 
Tel:  015 295 1000 
Fax: 015 295 1163 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

 Department of Transport and 
Community Safety, 40 Paul Kruger Street, 
POLOKWANE and all Provincial T reasury 
Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box 
located at 1st Floor, Paul 
Kruger Wing, 40 Paul 
Kruger Street, 
Polokwane 

 
 

106 COGHSTA 

 
Tel:  015 294 2000 
Fax: 015 295 4190 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Co-Operative 
Governance, Human Settlements & 
Traditional Affairs, 28 Market Street, 
Office No. G 74, Ground Floor, Polokwane. 

Deposited in the bid box 
located at Hensa 
Towers, Cnr of Rabe 
and Landdros Mare 
Streets, Polokwane 

 
 

107 
DSAC 

 
Tel:  015 284 4000 
Fax: 015 284 4514 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

 Department of Sport, Arts and Culture 
Olympic Towers, Corner Rabe and Biccard 
Street, POLOKWANE and all Provincial 
T reasury Tender Advice Centre 

Deposited in the bid box 
located in the main 
entrance of Olympic 
Towers, Corner  21 
Rabe and Biccard 
Street, Polokwane 

http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
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108 LEDET 

 
Tel:  015 293 8300 
Fax: 015 293 8319 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Economic Development, 
Environment & Tourism, 90 Bok Street, 
POLOKWANE and all SCM Advice Centres  

Deposited in the bid box 
located in the main 
entrance of Evridiki 
Towers, 19 Biccard 
Street, Polokwane 

 
109 

 
LDPW & 
WODP 

 
Tel:  015 284 7000 
Fax: 015 284 7031 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Public Works, Roads and 
Infrastructure 
 
; Towers, 43 Church Street, POLOKWANE 
and all Provincial T reasury Tender Advice 
Centres 

Deposited in the bid box 
located at Corner 
Blaawberg and River 
Street Ladanna 
Polokwane 0699 Private 
Bag X9490 Polokwane 
0700 

110  
ACDP 

 
Tel:  015 294 
3000/30/60/90/20 
Fax: 015 294 4506 
Website: 
www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Agriculture, Temo Towers, 
69 Biccard Street, POLOKWANE and all 
Provincial T reasury Tender Advice Centres 
                                                          

Deposited in the bid box 
located in the main 
entrance of AgriVillage, 
69 Biccard Street, 
Polokwane 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
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ANNEXURE 2:   ADDRESS LIST AND CONTACT DETAILS: LIMPOPO PUBLIC ENTITIES 
 

 
UNIQUE 

REF. 
NO. 

BID 
DOCUMENT 
REFERENCE 

 
CONTACT 
DETAILS 

 
DOCUMENTS 

SOLD AT: 

 
DOCUMENTS 

DEPOSITED AT 

 
111 

 
RFB: LIMP 

 
Tel: 015 293 3621 
Fax: 015 293 3660 
Website: www.golimpopo.com 

State Information Technology 
Agency (SITA) Limpopo Office, 
Moolman Building, 27 Market 
Street, POLOKWANE, 0699 
 

Bid box located in 
the Main Entrance of 
Moolman Building, 
27 Market Street, 
Polokwane 

 
112 

 
LTA 

 
Tel: 015 293 3600 
Fax: 015 293 3655 
Website: www.golimpopo.com 

Limpopo Tourism Agency, 
 ERF 92/688, Portion 2 Southern 
Gateway, Ext 4, N1 Main Road, 
Polokwane 0699 

Bid box located in the  
offices ERF 92/688, 
Portion 2 Southern 
Gateway, Ext 4, N1 Main 
Road, Polokwane 0699 

 
113 

 
LGB 

 
Tel: 015 295 5581 
Fax: 015 295 3566 
Website: www.lgb.org 

Limpopo Gambling Board,  
08 Hans van Rensburg Street, 
POLOKWANE, 0699 

Bid box located in the main 
entrance, 8 Hans van 
Rensburg Street, 
Polokwane, 0699 

 
114 

 
LEDA 

 
Tel: 015 633 4700 
Fax: 015 633 4854 
Website: www.leda.co.za 

Limpopo Economic 
Development Agency 
Enterprise Development Finance, 
Main Road Lebowakgomo 

Bid box located in the main 
entrance, Enterprise 
Development Finance, 
Main Road Lebowakgomo 

 
115 

 
RAL 

 
Tel: 015 284 4600 
Fax: 015 284 4701 
Website: www.ral.co.za 

Road Agency Limpopo (RAL), 
RAL Towers, 26 Rabe Street, 
POLOKWANE, 0700 

Bid box located in the 
entrance foyer (ground 
floor) of RAL Towers, at 26 
Rabe Street, Polokwane 

 
116 

 
GAAL 

 
Tel: 015 288 0122 
Fax: 015 288 0346 
Website: www.gaal.co.za 
 

Gateway Airports Authority 
Limited, N1 Road to Louis 
Trichardt, Army Base, 
POLOKWANE International 
Airport, Polokwane, 0700 

Bid box located in the main 
entrance, ground floor of 
administration building, 
Polokwane International 
Airport, Army Base 

 
117 

 
      VIVET 

Tel: 015 963 3156 
Fax: 015 963 3154 
Website: 
www.vhembecollege.edu.za 

Vhembe TVET  College, 
Central Office, Site No 203 
SIBASA 
0970 

Vhembe TVET  College, 
Central Office, Site No 203 
SIBASA 
0970 

118 WTVET Tel: 015 491 8581/8602 
Fax: 015 491 8579 
Website: www.procurement 
@waterbergcollege .co.za 

Waterberg FET College,  
Central Office, 36 Hooge Street 
Street, Mokopane, 0600 

Waterberg FET College,  
Central Office, 36 Hooge 
Street Street, Mokopane,  
Private Bag x 2449, 
Mokopane 0600 

119  GNT Tel. 015 291 2641  
Fax. 015 291 2648  

No. 130a Marshall Street, 
Polokwane.0700  

Great North Transport  
No. 130 Marshall Street, 
Polokwane.0700  

120 MT Tel. 015 2907715/7772  
 

Mvula Trust 
25 Rhodesdrift Street, Rhodesdrift 
Office Park, Bendor Ext 30, 
Polokwane 

Mvula Trust 
25 Rhodesdrift Street, 
Rhodesdrift Office Park, 
Bendor Ext 30, Polokwane 

121 CCTVET Tel.015 230 1800 
Fax. 015 291 2767 

Capricorn College for TVET  
16 Market Street, Polokwane 

Private Bag  Bag X9674 
Polokwane0700 

122 IDT Tel: 015 295 0000 
Fax: 015 295 6559 

Independent Development 
Trust 
22 Hans van Rensburg Street, 
Polokwane, 0700 

Independent 
Development Trust 
P.O.Box 55386 
Polokwane 0700 

http://www.golimpopo.co/
http://www.golimpopo.com/
http://www.lgb.org/
http://www.leda.co.za/
http://www.ral.co.za/
http://www.gaal.co.za/
http://www.vhembecollege.edu.za/
http://www.procurement/


LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL TENDER BULLETIN NO. 35 of 2021/22 FY 26 NOVEMBER 2021 

NOT FOR SALE Page 16 
    

123 DBSA  
scmqueries@dbsa.org 
 

Development Bank of Southern 
Africa 
Welcome Centre 
1258 Lever Road 
Midrand 

Development Bank of 
Southern Africa 
Welcome Centre 
1258 Lever Road 
Midrand 
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ANNEXURE 3: ADDRESS LIST AND CONTACT DETAILS: PROVINCIAL TREASURY TENDER ADVICE CENTRES 

(Tender bulletins and bid documents are obtainable from the following Centers): 
 

 
PROVINCIAL TREASURY SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT ADVICE CENTRES 

 

 
HEAD OFFICE 
 
Provincial Supply Chain Management Office 
56 – 58 Paul Kruger Street 
POLOKWANE 
Private Bag x9494 
POLOKWANE, 0700 

  Tel No. (015) 291 8400 
 
Contact: Ms. M.B Rakubu     @  Tel: 015 291 8717/6   
              

 
Capricorn SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
56-58 Paul Kruger Street 
Private Bag x9494 
POLOKWANE, 0700 
Tel No. (015) 291 8400 
 
Contact Person:  Ms. M.M. Masindi  

 
Vhembe SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
Government Building Complex 
BLOCK E GROUND FLOOR 
THOHOYANDOU, VENDA 
Tel: (015) 962 1752 
Fax: (015) 962 1282 
 
Contact Person: Ms. A Manena 

 
Mopani SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
Private Bag X 1973 
GIYANI, 0826 
Tel: (015) 812 0149 
Fax: 086 219 7905 
 
Contact Person: Mr. G Muravha  

 
Waterberg SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
98 Nelson Mandela Street 
Decimale  Building 
MODIMOLLE 
Tel: (014) 717 5837 
Fax: (014) 717 5670 
 
Contact Person: Mr. AT Tsatsi                

 
Sekhukhune SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
Lefa Centre, Schoonoord Road 
JANE FURSE 
Tel: (013) 265 1344 
Fax: (013) 265 1354 
 
Contact Person: Mr. M. S. Sehale  
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ANNEXURE 4: ADDRESS LIST AND CONTACT DETAILS: SATELLITE OFFICES  
 (Tender bulletins are obtainable from the following centers) 
 

CAPRICORN  VHEMBE MOPANI WATERBERG SEKHUKHUNE 

  
 

Libsa Thabazimbi: 
No.08 Riet Bok Street 
Tel. No. (014) 772 2437  

 

   Libsa Lephalale  
No. 3A Venter Street 
Tel. No. (014) 763 2834  
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